INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1A
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 12/13/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30107-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600340 DBE GOAL: 10.00
(CONTINUED) DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 19,050,000.00
CALL: 150 ROUTE: US 31 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 0.27 MILE SOUTH OF CR 500S TO 0.96 MILES NORTH
OF CR 500S
COUNTY: TIPTON HOWARD
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | | $ 379,269.52 | [
| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | [ | 1
| PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE | | $  629,053.36 | 11
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | | | [
| SECTION 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS | | $ 10.00 | R | X |
I | | | 1
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | $ 4,948,310.28 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | OH | | 11
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | OH | | [
34-4456871 | MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC | ARCHBOLD 419-445-1015 | $ 10,219,042.26 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | OH | | 11
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 6,586,941.42 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | IN | | 11
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 6,780,422.50 | R | |
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN I I 11
35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC | MILFORD 574-658-4166 | $ 12,172,820.58 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I | 11
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE  260-478-1548 | $ 4,481,154.35 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE  260-478-1548 | NO BID | 11
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE  260-478-1548 | $ 10,089,959.38 | R | |

| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | I [



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1B
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 12/13/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30107-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600340 DBE GOAL: 10.00
(CONTINUED) DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 19,050,000.00
CALL: 150 ROUTE: US 31 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 0.27 MILE SOUTH OF CR 500S TO 0.96 MILES NORTH
OF CR 500S
COUNTY: TIPTON HOWARD
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE  LOW REMARKS

35-1698047 | GRADEX INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-573-3970 | $ 4,525,669.33 | R | |

| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1698047 | GRADEX INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-573-3970 | $ 4,561,216.70 | R | |

| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN | | 11
35-1698047 | GRADEX INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-573-3970 | $ 10,432,620.61 | R | |

| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I 1
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 4,822,796.17 | R | |

| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | IN I I 11
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | NO BID | 1

| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN I I 1
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | INDIANAPOLIS 317-334-0758 | $ 11,675,879.08 | R | |

| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN I I 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 4,070,560.23 | R | X | AWARD

| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | IN | | | | DBE 10.13%
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | NO BID | 11

| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | IN I I 11
36-2231526 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | CROWN POINT  219-661-2450 | $ 10,008,644.59 | R | X | AWARD

| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | IN | | 11
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 5,230,159.94 | R | |

| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | M1 | | 11
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 5,472,702.01 | R | |

| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | M1 | | 11
38-2051611 | HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC | BATTLE CREEK 269-965-1207 | $ 11,273,366.10 | R | |

| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | mi I I 1



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1C
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 12/13/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT IR-30107-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600340 DBE GOAL: 10.00
(CONTINUED) DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 19,050,000.00
CALL: 150 ROUTE: US 31 GREENFIELD DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 0.27 MILE SOUTH OF CR 500S TO 0.96 MILES NORTH
OF CR 500S
COUNTY: TIPTON HOWARD
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE/FAX AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW REMARKS
38-2675420 | ANLAAN CORPORATION | FERRYSBURG  616-846-8442 | $ 4,975,808.39 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | M | | 1
38-2675420 | ANLAAN CORPORATION | FERRYSBURG  616-846-8442 | NO BID | 1
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | M I I 1
38-2675420 | ANLAAN CORPORATION | FERRYSBURG  616-846-8442 | $ 11,382,709.10 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | M I | 1
38-3082681 | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC | LEROY 231-768-4403 | $ 5,145,759.18 | R | |
| SECTION 0001 PCCP OPTION | M | I 1
38-3082681 | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC | LEROY 231-768-4403 | $ 5,321,062.50 | R | |
| SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION | M I I 1
38-3082681 | D J MCQUESTION & SONS INC | LEROY 231-768-4403 | $ 11,092,468.55 | R | |
| SECTION 0003 COMMON ITEMS | M I I 11

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDDERS 1S DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE
PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002,
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. (BIDS ON SECTION 0004 ARE FIXED BY INDOT FOR ALL BIDDERS.)

TOTAL OF LOW BID 1S $ 14,079,214.82 = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0003 + SECTION 0004.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 2
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT 1R-33986-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172337 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 103,260.00
CALL: 164 ROUTE: 60 SEYMOUR DISTRICT
LOCATION: ON SR 60 AT WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT NEAR
BLUE RIVER
COUNTY: WASHINGTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
34-1572955 | DEITERING LANDSCAPING INC | LEIPSIC | $ 349,357.50 |R | | IRREGULAR *
| | Ohio 419-943-2486 | | | |
34-2051654 | C A FULKERSON LLC | LANESVILLE | $ 196,763.80 |[R | X | AWARD **
| | Indiana 812-952-1777 | I 11
35-1801998 | CLR INC | VINCENNES | $ 258,403.40 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-886-0360 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 309,544.80 |[R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |
35-1990156 | EARTH IMAGES INC | GREENWOOD | $ 234,921.88 |[R | |
1 | Indiana 317-865-1503 | | | |

*FAILED TO SUBMIT A DRUG TESTING PLAN AND PERFORMANCE BOND WITH THE BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1)-
** AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 3
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -29975-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 4751010 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 654,415.00
CALL: 200 ROUTE: 450 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 450 OVER BEECH CREEK, 2.10 MILES EAST OF US 50

COUNTY: MARTIN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 583,985.09 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
35-1618530 | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE | $ 724,353.19 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-280-4404 | | | |
35-1801998 | CLR INC | VINCENNES | $ 631,561.69 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-886-0360 | | | |
35-1878024 | RAGLE INC | NEWBURGH | $ 611,969.53 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-853-9558 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 527,168.81 |[R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | 11 DBE 8.02%
38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 655,310.10 [R | |

| | Indiana 317-284-1195 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 4
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -30330-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 4089025 DBE GOAL: 8.00
DESCRIPTION: SIGHT DISTANCE IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,500,217.00
CALL: 210 ROUTE: 40 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 40 AT PENNVILLE ROAD/JACKSONBURG ROAD,
2.50 MILES EAST OF SR 1
COUNTY: WAYNE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0844079 | PAUL H ROHE COMPANY | AURORA | $ 1,523,685.97 |R | |
[ | Indiana 812-926-1471 | | 11
35-1128289 | BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC | BOGGSTOWN | $ 1,588,870.70 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-835-2254 | | | |
35-1151771 | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC | WHITESTOWN | $ 1,668,000.00 |[R | |
| | Indiana 317-769-1900 | | | |
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 1,683,700.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |

35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,452,630.00 |[R | X | AWARD

I | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | 11 DBE 8.08%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 5
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -31223-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0600696 DBE GOAL: 9.00
DESCRIPTION: ADDED TRAVEL LANES ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  2,340,000.00
CALL: 214 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON YEAGER ROAD FROM US 231 TO US 52

COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 2,648,628.00 |[R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1875662 | CRIDER & CRIDER INC | BLOOMINGTON | $ 2,442,031.64 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-336-4452 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 2,319,139.20 |[R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | 11 DBE 9.01%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 1
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/30/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -33078-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901453 DBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 1,150,000.00
CALL: 230 ROUTE: 500 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 500S FROM US 35 TO HUPP ROAD

COUNTY: LAPORTE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN |'$ 907,133.70 [R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | 11

35-1120685 | WALSH & KELLY INC | GRIFFITH | $ 875,603.09 [R | X | AWARD

I | Indiana 219-924-5900 | I 11 DBE 5.07%



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 7
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -33255-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005470 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 434,000.00
CALL: 240 ROUTE: 1-465 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG 1-465 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

COUNTY: MARION

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM | $ 418,800.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | | |
35-1526557 | MIDWEST MOLE INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 492,288.00 [R | |
1 | Indiana 317-545-1335 | | | |
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 528,195.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |
35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC ] SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 329,716.50 |R | X AWARD

|
| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 8
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -33373-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005922,1005921,1005920 DBE GOAL: 3.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  340,000.00
CALL: 250 ROUTE: 69 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ALONG I 69 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT FORT WAYNE
DISTRICT
COUNTY: DEKALB STEUBEN
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1004746 | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM |'$ 769,226.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 812-883-6644 | | 11
35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 985,303.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | 11
35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC | SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 615,079.00 |R | X | AWARD *
| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | 11 DBE 3.87%

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 9
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT R -33652-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005835 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 203,050.00
CALL: 260 ROUTE: 50 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 50, 2.38 MILES EAST OF WEST JCT OF US 41

COUNTY: KNOX

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1009310 | DEIG BROTHERS LUMBER & CONSTR | EVANSVILLE |'$ 248,375.00 [R | |
| | Indiana 812-423-4201 | | [
35-1526557 | MIDWEST MOLE INC | INDIANAPOLIS | $ 217,040.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 317-545-1335 | | 11
35-2097364 | INDIANA RELINE INC | SULPHUR SPRINGS | $ 171,750.00 |[R | X | AWARD

| | Indiana 765-533-5040 | | | |



CONTRACT R

CALL: 270

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0090100
ROAD RECONSTRUCTION

ADDRESS

ENGINEER™

PAGE: 10
DATE: 12/09/11

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

ON ANNISTON DRIVE FROM WALNUT STREET TO MCFARLAND ROAD

AMOUNT OF BID

WEST CHESTER
Ohio

NOBLESVILLE
Indiana

GOSHEN
Indiana

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

ANDERSON
Indiana

WHITESTOWN
Indiana

BATESVILLE
Indiana

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

BATESVILLE
Indiana

-34075-A
DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:
COUNTY: MARION
BIDDER
| SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
I
| SHELLY & SANDS INC AND SUBSIDI
|
| RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION
I
| HUNT PAVING COMPANY INC
I
| E & B PAVING INC
I
| CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC
I
| OLCO INC
I
| SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO
I
| LINKEL COMPANY
I
| MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP

COLUMBUS
Indiana

DBE GOAL: 10.00

S ESTIMATE: $ 785,000.00
TYPE LOW REMARKS

IR 1 |

I 1

IR 1 |

| |

IR | X | AWARD

| 11 DBE 10.31%
IR 1 |

I [

IR 1 |

| |

IR 1 |

I 1

IR 1 | IRREGULAR *
I 1

IR 1 |

| |

IR 1 |

| | I

IR 1 |

*FAILED TO SUBMIT A POWER OF ATTORNEY LETTER FOR PERFORMANCE BOND WITH THE BID.

BID REJECTED

PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1).



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 11
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT RS-30917-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500286 DBE GOAL: 6.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $  1,490,000.00
CALL: 300 ROUTE: 231 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 231 FROM 1-65 TO US 24

COUNTY: WHITE

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION | GOSHEN | $ 1,555,848.77 |R | |
I | Indiana 574-875-5183 | | | |
35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE | $ 1,306,981.23 |R | X1 AWARD
| | Indiana 260-478-1990 | | | | DBE 6.02%
35-1621699 | CENTRAL PAVING INC | LOGANSPORT | $ 1,656,282.34 |[R | |
| | Indiana 574-722-4727 | | | |
35-1917625 | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP | COLUMBUS | $ 1,583,320.00 |R | |

| | Indiana 812-579-5248 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT RS-31987-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900261
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, MICROSURFACE

CALL: 310 ROUTE: SR 7

LOCATION: ON SR 7 FROM NORTH JUNCTION OF SR 3 AND SR

COUNTY: BARTHOLOMEW JENNINGS

CODE BIDDER

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

7 TO US 31

AMOUNT OF BID

4.00
$

PAGE: 12
DATE: 11/29/11

1,230,000.00

REMARKS

26-2688853 | STRAWSER CONSTRUCTION INC |

COLUMBUS
Ohio

INDIANAPOLIS
Indiana

SALEM
Indiana

AWARD

43-1878237 | MICRO SURFACING INC |

ST LOUIS
Missouri

TYPE LOW
R
| I
IR 1 |
I (.
IR 1 X1
I (.
L



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 13
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

MBE GOAL: 0.00
CONTRACT RS-34094-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901892 WBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 132,500.00
CALL: 320 ROUTE: VINCENNES DISTRICT
LOCATION: AT PATOKA LAKE RECREATION AREA
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
11-3838875 | CALCAR PAVING INC | JASPER | $ 136,000.00 |[R | X | AWARD*
[ | Indiana 812-482-1024 | | 11
35-0626844 | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY | EVANSVILLE | $ 193,362.25 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-476-4921 | I 11
35-1357381 | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC | NORTH VERNON | $ 159,532.00 |[R | |
| | Indiana 812-346-4135 | | | |
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE | $ 166,000.00 |R | |
| | Indiana 812-282-1349 | | | |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT RS-34109-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1172423
DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE
CALL: 330 ROUTE: SP PARK

LOCATION: AT HARMONIE STATE PARK

COUNTY: POSEY

ENGINEER"S
VINCENNES D

AMOUNT OF BID T

MBE GOAL:
WBE GOAL:
ESTIMATE:

ISTRICT

YPE LOW

0.00
0.00
$

PAGE: 14
DATE: 11/29/11

250,000.00

REMARKS

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS
35-0626844 | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY | EVANSVILLE
| | Indiana
35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC | ANDERSON
| | Indiana

35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE
| | Indiana

PHONE

| $
812-476-4921 |

| $
765-643-5358 |

| $

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS

THAN $1,000,000.00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

FOR THE LETTING OF November 16,
CONTRACT RS-34210-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173182
DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, ULTRATHIN BONDED WEARING COURSE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:
CALL: 340 ROUTE: 64
LOCATION: ON SR 64 FROM WEST JCT OF SR 145 TO EAST JCT OF SR 145
COUNTY: CRAWFORD DUBOIS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE
35-2040801 | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE | $
| | Indiana 812-282-1349 |

2011

DBE GOAL:

VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE:
DATE:

9.00
$ 530,000.00

REMARKS

AWARD*
DBE 9.17%

15
11/29/11

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00.



CONTRACT B

CALL: 380

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

SEYMOUR DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

T

YPE LOW

10.00
$

1,012,0

REMARKS

PAGE: 16
DATE: 11/29/11

00.00

-29428-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500907
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
ROUTE:
LOCATION: ON CR 300N OVER CLIFFY CREEK
COUNTY: DECATUR
BIDDER ADDRESS
| BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC BOGGSTOWN
| Indiana
| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC NORTH VERNON
| Indiana
| FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC COLUMBUS
| Indiana
| MCALISTER EXCAVATING CO INC PATRIOT
| Indiana
| AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE
| Indiana
| MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP COLUMBUS

Indiana



CONTRACT B

CALL: 390

ON YANKEETOWN ROAD OVER LITTLE PIGEON CREEK

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9982660
BRIDGE REHABILITATION OR REPAIR

DBE GOAL: 10.00
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

VINCENNES DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

$

PAGE: 17
DATE: 11/29/11

782,800.00

REMARKS

EVANSVILLE
Indiana

AWARD
DBE 10.27%

VINCENNES
Indiana

NEWBURGH
Indiana

-29596-A
DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:
COUNTY: WARRICK
BIDDER
| DEIG BROTHERS LUMBER & CONSTR
I
| CLR INC
|
| RAGLE INC
I
| DAVIS CONSTRUCTION INC

LANSING
Michigan



CONTRACT B

CALL: 400

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

DBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

GREENFIELD DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID

T

YPE LOW

4.00
$

3,900,0

REMARKS

PAGE: 18
DATE: 11/29/11

00.00

AWARD

-29699-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9682190
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
ROUTE: CR 600W
LOCATION: ON CR 600W OVER SUGAR CREEK
COUNTY: SHELBY
BIDDER ADDRESS
| SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY WEST CHESTER
I Ohio
| BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC BOGGSTOWN
I Indiana
| DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC FRANKLIN
| Indiana
| DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC NORTH VERNON
| Indiana
| GEORGE R HARVEY & SON INC DANVILLE
I Indiana
| FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC COLUMBUS
| Indiana
| AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE JEFFERSONVILLE
| Indiana
| RAGLE INC NEWBURGH
| Indiana
| MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP COLUMBUS
| Indiana
| HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC INDIANAPOLIS

Indiana



CONTRACT B -30464-A

CALL: 420

DESCRIPTION:
ROUTE:
LOCATION:

COUNTY:
BIDDER

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 2262006

SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT

us 20

ON US 20 OVER KINTZELE DITCH, 1.7 MILES WEST

LAPORTE

ADDRESS

DBE GOAL: 10.00
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT
OF US 421

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

$

370,00

REMARKS

PAGE: 19
DATE: 11/29/11

0.00

MUNSTER
Indiana

MICHIGAN CITY
Indiana

AWARD
DBE 1

*

2.12%

| Jci

BRIDGE GROUP

INC

LAPORTE
Indiana

LAPORTE
Indiana

| GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO

INC

GARY
Indiana

| WOODRUFF & SONS

INC

MICHIGAN CITY
Indiana

DYER
Indiana

| ELLAS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

INC

GARY
Indiana

| HRP CONSTRUCTION

INC

SOUTH BEND
Indiana

| GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION

INC

HIGHLAND
Indiana

| PIONEER ASSOCIATES

INC

ALBION
Indiana

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.

| | |
|'$ 462,078.22 |[R | X |
| | |
|'$ 644,922.64 |[R | |
| | |
| $ 695,258.19 |[R | |
| | |
| $ 569,900.00 [R | |
| | |
| $ 608,846.50 [R | |
| | |
| $ 563,034.34 |[R | |
| | |
| $ 528,110.61 [R | |
| | |
|'$ 533,995.51 |[R | |
| | | I
|'$ 723,512.65 IR | |
| | |
|'$ 519,997.33 IR | |
| | |
00.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 20
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT B -30876-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500069 DBE GOAL: 9.00
DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ 425,000.00
CALL: 430 ROUTE: IR 1018 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON DAWKINS ROAD OVER LITZENBURG DRAIN

COUNTY: ALLEN

CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1057237 | R L MCCOY INC | COLUMBIA CITY | $ 439,886.52 |R | |
| | Indiana 260-625-3443 | | | |
35-1374866 | PRIMCO INC | FORT WAYNE | $ 389,418.81 |[R | |
| | Indiana 260-478-1548 | | | |
35-1817530 | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | ALBION | $ 380,189.52 [R | X | AWARD
| | Indiana 260-636-3000 | | | | DBE 9.18%
38-1912617 | DAVIS CONSTRUCTION INC | LANSING | $ 541,539.07 |R | |
| | Michigan 517-322-3800 | | | |
38-2405622 | E T MACKENZIE COMPANY | GRAND LEDGE | $ 525,354.62 |[R | |

I | Michigan 517-627-8408 | | | |



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PAGE: 21
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 11/29/11
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

CONTRACT B -31643-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810039 DBE GOAL: 0.00
DESCRIPTION: SCOUR PROTECTION ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE: $ NONE BELOW
CALL: 440 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS ROUTES IN THE CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT
COUNTY: BENTON MONTGOMERY
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS

35-1523985 | WIRTZ & YATES INC | KENTLAND | $ 298,710.60 |R | | REJECTED*
[ | Indiana 219-474-6542 | | 11

35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE | $ 284,209.00 |[R | | REJECTED*
| | Indiana 812-934-5190 | | | |

35-1673827 | H E HENDERSON INC | MARTINSVILLE | $ 238,631.06 |[R | X | REJECTED*
| | Indiana 765-342-2662 | | | |

35-1801998 | CLR INC | VINCENNES | $ 258,789.56 |R | | REJECTED*
| | Indiana 812-886-0360 | | | |

35-1817574 | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE | ANDERSON | $ 278,215.50 |R | | REJECTED*
| | Indiana 765-378-5783 | | | |

NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE - REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED FOR JAN 11, 2012 LETTING.



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

MBE GOAL:

CONTRACT M -31164-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800467 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, MOWING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 470 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG 1-94, 1-80 AND SR 912
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE | $ 181,803.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 812-934-5190 | | 11
35-2034028 | C & H MOWING INC | HEBRON | $ 136,503.00 |[R | X |

| | Indiana 219-996-7273 | | | |

PAGE: 22
DATE: 11/29/11

©# OO
oo
oo

168,000.00

REMARKS



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

MBE GOAL:

CONTRACT M -31166-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800469 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE MOWING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 480 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN LAPORTE DISTRICT
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE | $ 147,603.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 812-934-5190 | | 11
35-2154772 | COMPTONS MOWING SERVICE INC | STAR CITY | $ 89,563.00 [R | X |

| | Indiana 574-595-7370 | | | |

PAGE: 23
DATE: 11/29/11

©# OO
oo
oo

106,000.00

REMARKS



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

PAGE: 24
DATE: 11/29/11

©# OO
oo
oo

47,000.00

REMARKS

MBE GOAL:

CONTRACT M -31167-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800470 WBE GOAL:
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, MOWING ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

CALL: 490 ROUTE: VARIOUS LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG US 24 BYPASS, SR 29, AND US 35 IN LOGANSPORT, CASS,
AND MIAMI COUNTIES
COUNTY: VARIOUS
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE | $ 59,403.00 [R | |
I | Indiana 812-934-5190 | | 11
35-2154772 | COMPTONS MOWING SERVICE INC | STAR CITY | $ 39,563.00 [R | X |

| Indiana 574-595-7370 | I o



INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF November 16, 2011

MBE GOAL:
WBE GOAL:
ENGINEER"S ESTIMATE:

LAPORTE DISTRICT

AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW

PAGE: 25
DATE: 11/29/11

©# OO
oo
oo

98,000.00

REMARKS

CONTRACT M -31168-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800471
DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE MOWING
CALL: 500 ROUTE: 65
LOCATION: ALONG 1-65 THROUGHOUT LAPORTE DISTRICT
COUNTY: LAKE JASPER NEWTON
CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE
35-1636776 | LINKEL COMPANY | BATESVILLE
| | Indiana 812-934-5190 |
35-2034028 | C & H MOWING INC | HEBRON

| Indiana 219-996-7273 |



