BID TABULATION FOR ROAD DEPARTMENT PURCHASES - YEAR 2022  December 07/2021

GASOLINE, MOTOR OIL, TRAFFIC PAINT, REFLECTIVE SIGN FACE MATERIAL,

& SIGN POST
Jacobi Ol Mid-America
Service, Inc. Uniform
GASOLINE - bond required
LOW SULPHUR - bond required
10,000 gallons unleaded 80% minimum $25,810.00
39,000 Gallons special fuel $117,351.00
MOTOR OIL - bond required
220 Galtons 15W 40 (55 gallon drums) $537.00
HYDRAULIC OIL - bond required
190-68 (55 gallon drums}) $353.55
GREASE MULTIGUARD - bond required
80W 90 (5 gallon containers) $59.20
GREASE LUBE - bond required
1251b cans $59.20
ANTIFREEZE - bond required
55 gallon drums Red Ext Hite $399.75
5 gallon drums Green Conv. §333.25
TRAFFIC PAINT - bond required There was rio bid.
3200 galions White Water Base There was no bid.
3200 gallons Yellow Water Base There was no bid.
(55 gallon drums or 5 gallon pail) There was o bid.
REFLECTIVE SIGN FACE MATERIALS - bond required
High Reflective, Wide Angle, assorted sizes There was no bid.
SIGN POST - hond required
Square two {2) pounds with 80 holes wood There was no bid.
Square two (2) pounds with 80 holes aluminum There was no bid.
UNIFORMS - 35 emplovees
Standard Work Uniform {six pants & six shirts each)
‘ Yaries
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BID TABULATION FOR ROAD DEPARTMENT PURCHASES - LP GAS, BITUMINOUS, & STONE - YEAR 2022 December 07/2021
Hrving Shelby Asphalt Supply [MAC Construction C&r
Materials Inc. | County Co-op Co., Inc. & Excavating, Inc{  Construction | Flynn Brothers
LP Gas
LP gas four (4) 1000 gallon tanks $1.54
Four (4) 1000 gafion tanks No Cost
LP gas two {2} 30% Fork Lift Cylinder $1.54
Two (2} 30# Fork Lift Cylinder Mo Cost
LP gas four (4) 100# Cylinders $1.54
Four (4) 1002 Cyfinders No Cost
BITUMINQOUS - bond required
Cold Patch: 1450 tons $100.00 $105.00
Hot Mix: price 2,950 tons
HMA 8.5 mm Surface $58.50 548.00 $52.00 561.00
HMA 12.5 mm Surface/Binder 351.50 847.00 $52.00
HMA Base $48.50 $45.00 $50.00
STONE - bond required
10,000 tons crushed limestone, sizes 1 1o 12
#2 Stone $9.70
£3 Stone 970
#5 Stone $10.00
#8 Stone $11.40
#11 Stone $12.20
20,000 tons crushed limestone, sizes 53 & 73
%53 Stone $9.20
%73 Stone $3.20
Rip Rap & Shot Rock per ton
Natural Sand $22.00
Rip Rep $11.75
Shot Rock $8.25
Surge Rock $8.85
Coarse Lime $7.50
Manufactured Sand $10.75
Ag Lime $7.50
Crusher Run $15.25
“delivered to Highway Garage $5.95 ton
“haul rate $105 hour-tri-axles
CONCRETE WMIX - bond required
3,000 psi performance blend There was oo bid.
3500 psi performance blend There was no bid.
4000 psi performance bland There was no bid,
4500 psi performance biend There was no bid.
Flowable Fill 500-CDF Performance C/S There was no bid.
Course Grout 250 Performance Blend There was no bid.,
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