Floyd County Indiat
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Bid Opening Form
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Endzana Diamaﬁe Solutions, LLC
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ASPHALT SUPPLY CO, INC.

A,,Ei

.‘ QUOTE O‘N‘ASPHALT— l.\-/I.IX PE|C|NG
 Date: 11/28/2020
Plant: Cooper Lane-PIant
Quoted to: Floyd Co. Commissioners

Project: 2021 County Bids

" Hot Mix: 2,950 tons or less to be p.icked‘up at plant site by the Floyd Céunty Road Department.

© Mix Design ~ Quote Price -
Surface o . $45.00 per ton
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SPECIAL PROVISIONS: F. O.' B. P,Iant




Floyd County Indiana

County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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" Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
- County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
Company Name Mid-America Uniforms Umfiﬁ_’ii
Description Cost
T-Shirt w/Pocket $8.29
Polo Shirt w/Pocket $17.10
‘Button Work Shirt: Short Sleeve Heavyweight $18.39
Button Work Shirt: Short Sleeve Lightweight $18.99
_Bution Work SEE iong Sleeve Heavyweight _§_{91:§§_,
Button Work Shirt: Long Sleeve Lightweight $19.99
Sweatshirt: _Crewneck Pwlg_ll;q\jgf__ __$13.89
_Sweatshirt: Hooded Pullover EZWQ_
Sweatshirt: Hooded Zipper Front _$34.00
~ Sweatshirt:  Thermal Insulated Hooded Zip Front $49.95
Dickies Brand Jeans $23.00
Dickies Brand Carpenter Jeans $25.95
Wrangler Brand Jeans | $27.95
tee Brand Jeans _ $28.00_
_Industrial Work Pants $19.99
_Hooded Insulated Duck Jacket 549.00
insuiated Defuxe Bib-Overall $69.00
Screenprint ngo | %E?_
Oversizes: T-Shirts 2X-3XL Add $3.00  4X-5XL Add $6.00
Other items: XXL-Larger Add 20%
Pants: 44W-Larger Add 20%




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

Company Name 2 ,___. Miaterial Bid Q}ﬁ @lﬂaVLf of- %@m@_ﬁ’_
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Shelby County Co-op
2350 E St Rd 44
Shelbyville, IN 46176
317-392-5677 ~ 800-223-4171
www.shelbycountyco-op.com

December 15, 2020

Floyd County Highway Garage
Propane Contract '

Shelby County Co-op will provide propane for the Floyd County Highway Garage
located at 6412 Old Georgetown Road for a maximum price of $1.30 per gallon. Current
cash price is $1.21 per gallon. If the cash market drops below $1.30 a lower price will be
offered. There are no additional delivery fees or surcharges.

This price will be guaranteed for the months of January 1, 2021 thru December 31, 2021.
The following equipment is provided at no cost.

4 — 1000 gallon tanks

2 — 30# forklift cylinders

4 — 100# cylinders

All necessary pressure regulators

If you have any questions please feel free to call me at 800.223.4171.

Thanking you in advance for your propane business.

S;?cerely,

Paul Hammersmith

Propane Manager
Shelby County Co-op




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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F!oyd county Iindiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
Company Name E! ~ N Dot S Material Bid ASCUHA
LONTMA LG e
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
Company Name C&R Construction Motertal id f)l Fum NS
Description Cost
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Bid Opening Form
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Fle ounty Indiana
C@unw Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Irving Materials, Inc.

1100 QUARRY ROAD NW
CORYDON , IN 47112
PHONE (812) 738-2216
FAX (812} 738-8400

Irving Materials, inc.
Bid Offer or Proposal
Floyd County, IN
Calendar Year 2021
Bid Date: 12/15/2020

Irving Materials, Inc.

Cold Paich

Class or ltem Quantity Unit Description Unit Price| Amount
Hot Mix 2,950 Tons or Less Ton HMA 9.5 MM Surface | $50.00
HMA 12.5 MM Surface | $48.00
Coid Patch 1,450 tons or Less Ton High Performance $150.00

All of the above prices are FOB Quarry

irving Materials, Inc.
1100 Quarry Road NW
Corydon, IN 47112
Phone 812 738-2216
Fax 812 738-8400




Irving Materials, Inc.

1100 QUARRY ROAD NW

CORYDON , IN 47112
PHONE (812) 738-2216
FAX  (812) 738-8400

Irving Materials, Inc.

Bid Offer or Proposal - ltem # 1 Stone

Floyd County, IN
Calendar Year 2021

Bid Date: 12/15/2020

irving Materials, Inc.

Class or ltem Quantity Unit Description Unit Price| Amount
Crushed Limestone |10,000 tons or less Ton |#2 Stone $8.95
sizes 1-12 inclusive Ton |# 3 Stone $8.95
20,000 tons or less Ton  |#5 Stone $8.95
sizes 53 or 73 and Ton  |# 8 Stone $10.65
Rip Rap as set forth Ton {#9 Stone $10.65
in the specifications Ton |#11 Stone $11.45
adopted by the IN ‘
Dept of Trans. Ton |#53 Stone $8.45
Ton # 73 Stone $8.45
Ton  |Asphalt Sand $20.00
Ton |Rip Rap $13.50
Ton  [Shot Rock $7.50
Ton [Surge Rock $8.10
Ton |Coarse Lime $6.75
Ton [Manufactured Sand $10.00
Ton |AgLime $6.75
Ton  [Crusher Run $14.50

All of the above prices are FOB Corydon Quarry

Haul Rate Delivered to Misc Sites - $95 / Hour - Tri-axles

Delivered to Highway Garage From Corydon Quarry - 6412 Old Georgetown Rd - $5.00 per ton

Irving Materials, Inc.

1100 Quarry Road NW

Corydon, IN 47112

Phone 812 738-2216

Fax 812 738-8400




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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c@mw Hsghway & Pubilic kas

Bid Opening Form
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lrving Materials, Inc.
P.0.Box D

1019 E Utica Street
Sefllersburg, IN 47172
PHONE ({812) 246-3383

FAX (B12) 246-7349

irving Materials, inc,
Bid Offer or Proposal
Fioyd County, IN
Calendar Year 2021
Bid Date: 12/15/2020

Irving Materials, Inc.

Cold Paich

Class or ltem Quantity Unit Description Unit Price | Amount
Hot Mix 2,950 Tons or Less Ton HMA 9.5 MM Surface | $49.00
HMA 12.5 MM Surface | $47.00
7 Cold Patch 1,450 tons or Less Ton High Performance $150.00

Ali of the above prices are FOB Quarry

Irving Materials, Inc.
1019 East Utica Street
Sellershurg, IN 47172
Phone 812 246-3383
Fax 812 246-7349




Irving Materials, Inc.
P.0.Box D

1019 E Utica Street
Selersburg, IN 47172

PHONE (812) 246-3383 Irving Materials, Inc.

FAX (812) 246-7349

Irving Materials, Inc.

Bid Offer or Proposal - ltem # 1 Stone
Fioyd County, IN

Caiendar Year 2021

Bid Date: 12/15/2020

Class or ltem Quantity Unit Description Unit Price| Amount

Crushed Limestone {10,000 tons or less Ton # 2 Slone $8.95
sizes 1-12 inclusive Ton |# 3 Stone $8.95

20,000 fons or less Ton  |Crusher Run $8.95

sizes 53 or 73 and Ton |#8 Stone $10.65

Rip Rap as set forth Ton  |# 53 Stone $8.45

in the specifications Ton [#73 Stone $8.45

adopted by the IN Ton  [# 11 Stone $11.45

Dept of Trans. Ton Rip Rap $11.00

Ton  [Shot Rock $7.50

Ton |Surge Rock $8.10

Ton [Manufactured Sand $10.00

Ton |AgLime $6.75

Ton |Natural Sand $20.00

Ton [#5 Stone $8.95

All of the above prices are FOB Sellersburg Quarry

Haut Rate Delivered to Misc Sites - $90 / Hour - Tri-axles

Delivered to Highway Garage from Sellersburg Quarry - 6412 Old Georgetown Rd - $5.95 per ton

Irving Materials, Inc.
1019 East Utica Street
Sellersburg, IN 47172
Phone 812 246-3383
Fax 812 246-7349




Floyd County India
County Highway & Public Works

Yos- 2o 21
Bid Opening Form
Companyieme L i Saderalys N ?,;’z: {é}:/ Lt S A iz
54’-//ﬂrf£a/-,n;.7 Feanry
Description _ Cost
# 2 S £.95
#_ 5 Stene - dn
Crether fon g 95
H F Shoae jo 65
H 53 linet #H T3 S 2
H_I A p8.45
Ziz Loy /oo
Sho o R.c £ 7. Se
j;““;)r:. Lec Kk g o
/hﬁnuyﬁc,ﬁfe:f Son S jo, e®
Aslime £.7s
ﬂﬁ 'fé‘/’“éi’ / ,(/)A,,/ Zo, ¢o
#‘?‘. 5 /r#{v/:ef ?;-’ c?gf

Al _peices ace [Fof Sellerfbinrg R
Defiveae/ A /ilfj'f‘-”ﬂ? borsce K S'ﬁ'fgf.f Ao
Nellveqed S0 Misc JebsTey # Go.oo fhowr

Al pPrsces ace W) oq
¢




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
Company Name MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc. Material Bid  Cold Patch - 1,450 Tons or Less
Description , Cost
TNDOT WP Co\d Mix Winter Blond 2100 pec-ton

TRNDAT  HP Cold Mix  Somver Slond £ 1000 per <o




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
Company Name MAC Construction & Excavating, Inc.  Material BId  Hot Mix - 2,950 Tons or Less
Description Cost
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

Company Name T)Q Uf;?ﬂﬂa Mlﬂ; )IC nlg }S INC . MateraiBid " DA/ /e 7- vy

Description Cost
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Date:

brving Materials, Inc.

Nov 30, 2020

Customer: FLOYD COUNTY ROAD DEPYT
Attention: brian walter

brian.walter@irvmat.com

Quote Number: MQO0047124_

(€s

NRMCA

MATIOMAL FEATY MIXED
ONCRETE ASSOTIATION

Project: FLOYD COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT 2021
Lecation: 6412 OLD GEORGETOWN RD., Georgetown, IN 47122
Total Yards: 500

Bid Date: Dec 03, 2020

Mix # Concrete Description Gross Price/CY *Discount
30118D 3000-PS| PERFORMANCE MIX $119.50 $3.00/CY
35115D 3500-P5i PERFORMANCE MEX $122.00 $3.00/CY
40%115D 4000-PSi PERFORMANCE MiX $124.50 $3.00/CY
45118D 4500-P51 PERFORMANCE MiX $127.00 $3.00/CY
9141N FLOWABLE FILE NON-REMOVABLE 500PSI $98.50 $3.00/CY
2515CG 2515CG - 2500 COARSE GROUT $124.50 $3.00/CY

Notes:

PRICING SUBJECT TO CHANGE PER SPECIFICATIONS AND DRAWINGS.

Fly ash mixes are subject to availability. If fly ash is not available, straight cement mixes will be used. Mixes will be priced as quoted. If
straight cement mixes are not guoted, add $5.00 to performance price.

Proper truck washout area must be provided on site.

Concrete and aggregate testing outlned in job specifications can be provided by IM} at the expense of the contractor {if applicable}.

Accepted By

Haligays ang Sundays

“Environmental Fee, per load™

1% Caicium Chlorde

Additional Bag of Type | Cement, add/cy
Excess unlpading over 60 minutes charged per hour
High Range Water Reducer, add/cy

Ice, perlb

Late Delivery, After 5:00 PM, per load

Low Chlotide Accelerator, Per Dose
Mid-Range Water Reducer, add/cy
Non-Chloride Accelerator, per dose
Reinforcing Fiber, add/cy

Retarding Admixture, per dosa

Saturday Delivery, per [oad

Small Load Charge 2 yards or less

Small Load Charge 2.25 - 3.75 yards

Type lll Replacement, when avaifable add/cy
Winter Service (Nov 1 - Mareh 31), add /CY

Additional Charges
TBD

$12.00
$3.50
$6.50
$90.00
$7.50
$0.60
$75.00
$4.50
$5.00
$5.50
$7.00
$3.50
$50.00
$200.00
$100.00
$6.00
$4.00

*Terms: Accounts paid by the 10th of the following month after date of delivery
The above prices do not reflect state sales tax. Quote valid until Dec 31, 2020,

Quoted By: Brian Walter brian.waltex@jrvinat.com 502.639.2507
Please sign and return this quote to the salesperson kisted above to activate the pricing for this project.

Date:




diana
Comw nghway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

Compaey bame Hanson Aggregates - Aggrock Quarry Sismsieigsd  Stone

IN #53
IN #73
iN #2
IN #8
IN #11
IN #4
IN #5
Rip Rap

Haul Rate / Ton

$2.00

$8.85

$9.55

$11.05

$11.45

$10.30

No Bid

$11.25

$6.00




Flo yd Cou nty In

ana
County Highway & Public Works
Bid Opening Foim
Commypasry atwse Hanson Aggregates - Atkins Quarry _Bssedsiid  Stone
Deseription Cost
IN #53 $9.90
IN#73 $9.80
IN #2 $9.75
IN #8 $12.15
IN #11 No Bid
IN #4 No Bid
IN #5 No Bid
Rip Rap No Bid
Haul Rate / Ton $6.00




County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

Comgamyblams  Hanson Aggregates - Cooper Ln Quarry Matesiaiaid  Stone

Cost
IN #53 $9.15
IN#73 $9.00
IN #2 3950
IN #8 $11.75
IN #11 No Bid
IN #4 No Bid
IN #5 No Bid
Rip Rap No Bid
Haul Rate / Ton $6.00




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Description )@W’W{ épw‘ C}W)

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

' Bid Opening Form

Company Name /;U { l {fﬁ)ﬂ __j/VCz Material Bid é) (,{/ [/} l‘?ﬁ ?b/i )D €
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- Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

4 ’_' \ ,
Company Name C; U[ (&9 ﬂ MC Material Bid

Description Cost
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works |

Company Name

Bid Opening Form

CJU lcon THC.

Materiai Bid
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