plant: . Mailing:
16700 sima Gray Road PRECAST, INC. 7515 Old Hwy 111
HEnrvaIle, IN 47126 Memphis, IN 47143

Visit our website @ www.smprecast.com
Manholes - Storm Products - Grease Traps - Septic Tanks
"NPCA" CERTIFIED PLANT & "WBE" Enterprise
Phone: (812) 246-6258 * Fax: (812) 294-4862
sales@smprecast.com ** emayfield@smprecast.com ** sporter@smprecast.com

QUOTE

PROJECT #: TBD
pROJECT NAME: 2020 County Materials Bid
PROJECT LOCATION: Southern Indiana

WE PROPOSE TO SUPPLY THE FOLLOWING PRECAST ITEMS FOR THE PROJECT LISTED ABOVE:

i
Concrete Box Culverts
Price Per Ft Price Per Ft
Boy Size End Area Wt. Per C-850 <2' Cover Box Size End Area Wt. Per C-850 <2' Cover
Span x Rise sq. Ft. Ft. (ibs) HL-93 Load +35PSF Span X Rise Sq. Ft. Ft. (ibs) HL-93 Load +35PSF
3-Sided Flat Top Concrete Bridge Units
144 6,800 $755 19x9 152 6,900 $767
144 7,100 $798 19x10 152 7,300 $821
60 5,000 $691
80 5,400 $709
100 5,700 $722
120 6,100 $757
140 6,400 $794
160 6,800 $829
160 7,100 $849
160 7,500 $868

OX culverts include joint mastic & 12" external joint wrap

WS up to 45 degrees available on most sizes at an additional charge

 Delivery to jobsite included; 1 hour unload time included; Any extra tlme $150 per hour

' eCEa] or partial loads will be subject to additional charges

er depths of less than 2 ft require EPOXY coated reinforcement per INDOT - Add 10% to prices above
ax NOT Included

age 7 for wingwall pricing




Plant:
16700 Sima Gray Road
Henryville, IN 47126
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Memphis, IN 47143
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PRECAST, INC

Visit our website @ www.smprecast.com
Manholes — Storm Products — Grease Traps — Sepfiic Tanks
“NPCA” CERTIFIED PLANT & “WBE” Enterprise
Ph (812) 246-6258 * Fax (812) 294-4862

2020 Annual Bid

General Notes For Concrete Box Culverts & 3-Sided Flat Top
Concrete Bridge Units

1. Pricesinclude delivery to County Project Jobsite.

2. All materials meet all federal and state highway specifications with a design load to meet
AASHTO guidelines and INDOT specifications {HL-93 + 35 psf}

3. All materials are manufactured in the United States of America.
4. Material certifications (Buy American} are available upon request.

5. S&M can provide design drawings signed and sealed by a professional engineer licensed in the
state of indiana.




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
C&R Construction

Company Name

Material Bid 154 “\”U minows

Description Cost
Bituminous Hot miw Swvlace g 528
Dituminous  Hob miy loateranediate § 49.2¢
Rirvminons  Hot Wiy Rasc U445
Co\d Mix 8 110.00




Company Name

Floyd County Indiana
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

Company Name Hanson Aggregates - Aggrock Quamy  Material Bid

Description

Stone

IN # 53

Cost

IN# 73

$8.85

IN#2

$8.70

IN#8

$9.25

IN # 11

$10.75

IN#4

$11.15 -

Rip Rap

$10.30

$11.00

Haul Rate / Ton

$6.00

(No Tax Included in Prices)




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form

Company Nams Hanson Aggregates - Atkins Quarry Material Bid Stone

Description Cost
IN # 53 $9.65
IN#73 $9.45
IN#2 $9.55
IN#8 $11.85
IN# 11 No Bid -
IN#5 No Bid
Rip Rap No Bid
Haul Rate / Ton $6.00

(No Tax Included in Prices)




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works
Bid Opening Form
Compaiy Mame Hanson Aggregates - Cooper Ln Quany mMaterial Bid Stone
Description Cost

IN#53 $8.95
IN#73 $8.80
iN#2 $9.30
IN#8 $11.45
IN#11 No Bid -
IN#5 No Bid
Rip Rap _ ) No Bid
Haul Rate / Ton $6.00
(No Tax Included in Prices)




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Deposit Date: 11/8/2019
Lockbox: 10951

Baich: 9005
Transaction: 8




Floyd County Indiana

County Highway & Public Works Yeor Ze 2o
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Deposit Date: 11/82019

Lockbox: 10951
Batch: 9005
Transaction: 6




Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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Floyd County Indiana
County Highway & Public Works

Bid Opening Form
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